PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

cRERIF
« PANOL4

Office: 903-693-0333
Fax:  903-693-9366

314 W. Wellington
Carthage, Texas 75633

Sheriff Cutter Clinton

03-17-2026
HONORABLE COMMISSIONER’S COURT
Re: Food Bid

It is my recommendation the below listed companies be awarded contracts for food items for the
1 April 2026 through 30 September 2026 period.

Sysco
Flowers Foods

Reggectfully,

IR Yo

Lt. Scott M. Jones

Honesty, Integrity, Service



PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

ERI,
Office: 903-693-0333 ‘f’“ o 314 W. Wellington
Fax:  903-693-9366 @ Carthage, Texas 75633
Count

Sheriff Cutter Clinton

February 20, 2026

Flowers Food

Attn: Tricia Binnion
1200 W. Erwin
Tyler, Tx 75702

Re: Bids for Food Items

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be
purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. It is requested by the auditor’s
office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. | would appreciate a bid on any and
all items/products that you sell. If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in “not applicable” in the cost
column. All entries must be typed; electronic format is available upon request.

If you do not wish to submit a bid, please fax this letter back “No Bid Submitted” and your signature.

The items selected for purchase will be for a six-month period, beginning April 1, 2026, through September 30, 2026. It
is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis.

The Panola County Commissioners Court request | have the bids in hand by 12:00pm on March 13, 2026. You may
return by mail, email or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and consideration.

Lt. Scott M. Jones, Jail Administrator
Panola County Detention Center
scott.jones@co.panola.tx.us
903-693-0359 Office

903-693-2980 Fax

COMPANY NAME Flowers Baking Company of Tyler, LLC

NO BID SUBMITTED

BID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHED X

Honesty, Integrity, Service



PANOLA COUNTY JAIL
FOOD ITEMS BID SHEET
APRIL 1, 2026 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2026

ITEM NUMBERS AND PRICES MUST BE LISTED

ITEM # BRAND PKG.SIZE DESCRIPTION PRICE
19810140 BREAD 24 oz__|White Sandwich Bread $1.80 (20 02)
N/A BREAD 24 oz  |Wheat Sandwich Bread N/A
19825760 BREAD 8 ct. Hamburger Buns $1.77
19827300 BREAD 8 ct. Hot Dog Buns 5177
19815080 BREAD 24 oz  |Honey Wheat Bread ¢1.70 (20 o7)
N/A BREAD 41/2 Bulk SD N/A
N/A BREAD 12 ct. |Won Honey DNR RO N/A
N/A BREAD 30 ct.  |4" Bulk Plain N/A
10029120 BREAD 24 ct.  |Krystal Rolls $4.58
N/A BREAD 8 ct. Holsum Jumbo N/A




PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

Office: 803-693-0333 gl 314 W. Wellington
Fax: ©03-603-9366 ° Carthage, Texas 75633
Count?
Sheriff Cutter Clinton
February 20, 2026
Sysco
Attn: Luke Johnson
4577 Estes Parkway
Longview, Tx 75603

Re: Bids for Food Items

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be
purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. It is requested by the auditor’s
office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. | would appreciate a bid on any and
all items/products that you sell, If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in “not applicable” in the cost
column. All entries must be typed; electronic format is available upon request.

if you do not wish to submit a bid, please fax this letter back “No Bid Submitted” and your signature.

The items bid selected for purchase will be for a six-month period, beginning April 1, 2026, through September 30, 2026.
It is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis.

The Panola County Commissioners Court request | have the bids in hand by 12:00 pm on March 13, 2026. You may
return by mail, email or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and consideration.

Lt. Scott M. Jones, Jail Administrator
Panola County Detention Center

scott.jones@co.panola.tx.us
903-693-0359 Office

903-693-2980 Fax .
COMPANY NAME g“l ¢eo E"wf lagas
NO BID SUBMITTED

m
BID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHED

Honesty, integrity, Service




Food Bid Sheet - SYSCO EAST TEXAS 3/11/26

APRIL 1, 2026 Thru SEPTEMBER 30, 2026

Must use Excell Spreadsheet (Typed) and fill in "all " information

Typing Purposes if Requested**

**Electronic File Can Be Sent For

Pack Size Description Price | Item Number Pack/Size/Brand
6/#10 APPLESAUCE UNSWEETEND 44.24 7178439 6/#10/DELMONT
1/151B BACON BUFFET 18-22 L/O SLCD FZ 60.25 1265537 1/15LB/SYSREL
1/40 LB BANANA FRESH 24.94 1254440 40 LB PACKER
6/5LB BAKING PWDR 16.22 4040580 6/5LB/CLABGIR
1/1LB BASE BEEF NO MSG ADDED TFF 35.78 4944260 6/1LB/SYSIMP
1/1LB BASE CHICKEN NO MSG ADDED TFF 36.72 4944534 6/1LB/SYS IMP
6/50Z BASIL LEAVES 37.98 5228341 6/50Z/IMP/MCC
6/#10 BEAN BKD W/PORK 40.64 5501952 6/#10/ SHWBOAT
1/50 LB BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN 32.82 5829304 1/50LB/PACKER
2/5LB AV BEEF FOR STEW VP FZ 3.91 1813177 4/ 5#AVG / BHB/NPM
8/10#AV BEEF GRND FINE 80/20 4.99 0566838 4/ 10#AVG / FIRECLS
114/1.4OZ |BEEF STEAK FINGERS 55.61 7273016 114/1.40Z SYS CLS
160/30z BEEF AND CHICKEN PATTY LOAF PRECO 131.73 4975079 160/3 0Z/ MINUMAN
30/5.330z  |BEEF PATTY 83.29 2580058 60/5.30Z/FIRECLS
6/10# BLACKEYE PEAS 37.90 4114088 6/#10/SYSCLS
144/2.25 0z |BISCUIT FZ 40.54 9190513 144 /2.250Z / BKRSIMP
1/30lb BROCCOLI CUTS igf GRADE A 45.03 3831153 1/30 LB/ SYS CLS
6/5LB BREAD CRUMBS PLN 38.25 6675722 1/25LB/TEXAS
6/5LB BROWNIE MIX 49.42 1242439 6/5LB/SYS REL
72/4 0Z BURRITO BEEF & BEAN RED CHILI 52.64 8018132 72 /4 0Z/FRNANDO
4/51B CABBAGE SHRED SEP COLOR 25.20 1675701 4/5LB/IMPFRSH
6/5LB CAKE MIX WHI 39.44 5301601 6/5LB/SYSREL
6/#10 CARROT SLCD TFF 38.22 4257986 6/#10/SYS REL
1/6 CT CELERY FRSH 12.91 7197570 1/6CT/SYSIMP
1/30 0Z CELERY SALT NO MSG 49.10 5228465 6/300Z/IMP/MCC
4/5lb CHEESE AMER YLW 120 SL 44.81 5132234 4/5LB/BBRLCLS
4/5LB CHEESE CHED FTHR SHRED R/F 50.58 2404135 4/5LB / CASAIMP
2/5lb CHICKEN BRST STRIPS GOLD'N' SPICE 41.22 2584811 2/5LB/BRKBUSH
1/10 LB CHICKEN DICED WHI DARK 1/2" FC 39.91 6993851 2/5LB/SYSCLS
2/5LB AV CHICKEN NUGGET 29.00 8412780 2/5LB/TYSONRL
2/5lb CHICKEN BRST PATTY BREADED TYSON 23.89 8475695 2/5LB/TYSONRL
18 0Z CHILLI POWDER 5.54 5239496 6/1LB/SYSCLS
9/16 OZ CHIP POTATO ORGNL RIDGED 27.78 7221917 6/16 OZ/BBRLCLS
6/5LB CHILI BEEF HOMESTYLE NO BEAN FZ 86.93 3251154 6/5LB/TXCHILI
18/11LB COFFEE GRMT 185.94 6957799 18/140Z/CITVCLS
214/1.50Z |COOKIE DGH CHOC CHIP 57.66 8590376 200/1.50Z/BKRSCLS
80/40z COOKIE DGH M&M 70.77 9172222 80/40Z/DAVIDS
320/10Z COOKIE DGH BUTTER SUGAR 54.52 7040512 320/10Z/OTSPKMY
1/50 b CORNBREAD MIX SOUTHERN 43.40 6964243 1/50LBS/CMC




48/40z CORN DOGS TURKEY 22.70 1318773 36/2.750Z/SYS CLS
6/#10 CORN WHL KERNEL 42.66 4107520 6/#10/SYSCLS
4/1GA DRESSING RANCH TFF 51.57 4537645 4/1GAL/SYSCLS
4/1 GA DRESSING SALAD TFF 40.43 4002473 4/1GAL/SYS REL
12/18 0Z DRINK MIX GRAPE TFF 41.15 4138616 12/24 0Z/SYS CLS
12/18 OZ DRINK MIX PEACH TFF 44.30 4894259 12/240Z/SYSCLS
12/18 OZ DRINK MIX ORANGE TFF 41.08 4138608 12/240Z/SYSCLS
15/2lb EGG LIQUID SCRAMBLE MIX CARTON 56.02 2577054 15/2 LB/ WHLFCLS
1/15 DZ EGG SHELL LARGE GRADE A USDA WHITE 16.41 2105823 1/15DZ /WHLFCLS
3/10LB ELBOW MACARONI ELBOW PASTA 28.10 9688367 2/10LB/BARILLA
1/25 LB FLOUR H&R AP 18.50 8378111 1/50LB/SYS CLS
2/5LB FRANKS 8/1 TURKEY FZ 6" 24.19 4609723 2/5LB/SYSCLS
6/5LB FRIES 1/2 IN CC RTU TFF FZ 38.07 1994294 6/5LB /SYS REL
24/40Z FRUIT MIX IN PAIR JUICE 18.20 7144729 24/40Z/SYS CLS
1/32 0Z GARLIC CHPD WATER TFF 36.43 7127293 6/320Z/AREZCLS
6/14 OZ GRAVY MIX BRWN 29.55 8558215 6/150Z/SYS IMP
6/14 0Z GRAVY MIXWHITE 31.91 5078308 6/1.5LB/SYSIMP
8/5LB GRITS CEREAL HOT QUICK 40.10 2964401 8/5LB / QUAKER
6/#10 GREEN MIXED CHOPPED 39.88 5618749 6/#10/ALLENS
6/10# GREEN BEANS 37.19 3101583 6/#10/SYS CLS
2/10#AV HAM BUFFET 35% SMKD 3.42 6992384 2/9-11#/BBRLREL
1/24ct ICEBERG LETTUCE 25.82 1908318 1/24CT/SYFPNAT
400/10GM |JELLY VAR #10 CUP 38.75 5258835 400/10 GM/ SYS REL
70/4 0Z JUICE ORANGE CARTON 100% FZ 35.99 2200319 96 /4 0Z/ARDMORE
70/4 OZ JUICE APPLE CARTON 100% FZ 21.53 1436171 70/40Z/ARDMORE
6/#10 KETCHUP 29% CONC TFF 38.43 5686266 6/#10/HSRCIMP
4/960z MAC & CHEESE 59.84 1614452 4/8LB/SYSCLS
30/1LB MARGARINE SOLIDS 40.92 5164175 30/1LB/SYSCLS
900/5 GM MARGARINE SPREAD WHIPPED CUP 26.84 7116605 600/5G/GLDNSWT
4/1GA MAYO HD 41.47 4002432 4/1GAL/ SYS REL
6/1 GA MILK WHL 22.66 4676306 4/1GAL/WHLFCLS
1/10LB MUSHROOM BUTTON SM 28.25 1182229 1/10LB/IMPFRSH
4/1 GA MUSTARD PLAS RED BOY 30.86 4728858 4/1GAL/SYSREL
1/50 LB OATS QUICK 59.11 6561138 1/50LB/GILSTER
6/1 GA OIL SOY SALAD TFF 40.50 4119079 1/35LB/SYS REL
1/10LB ONION YLW MED 16.39 1098516 1/50#/IMPFRSH
138 CT ORANGES 48.08 7651967 1/138 CT RELIANCE
6/5LB PANCAKE MIX BUTTERMILK 34.97 6747968 6/5LB/CONSTGA
1/100Z PARSLEY FLAKES 14.05 5229265 3/100Z/IMP/MCC
2/5LB AV PASTA EGG NOODLES 1/4" 23.22 4863007 2/5LB/LABELLA
1/20LB PASTA SPAGHETTI 27.55 4862983 2/10LB/LABELLA
6/#10 PEACH SLICED EXTRA IN LIGHT SYRUP 62.92 2182063 6/#10/SYS CLS
6/5LB PEANUT BUTTER CRMY TFF 61.26 4009189 6/5LB/SYSCLS
6/#10 PEAS & CARROT 51.44 6819890 6/#10/ALLENS




1/10 LB PEPPER BLK GRND BULK 29.80 5935689 3/5LB/SYSCLS
1/96CT P1ZZA SAUSAGE WHOLE GRAIN SMART 72.10 1227756 1/96 CT/TONYS
2/10 LB POTATO DICED CK RUSSET SKINLESS M. 25.61 3009406 2/10LB/SYSCLS
6/#10 POTATO INST MASHED W/VITAMIN C 72.73 6920993 12/31 0Z/BASICAM
6/#10 POTATO YAM CUT TFF 57.19 4114625 6/#10/SYS CLS
6/#10 PUDDING VANILLA 49.07 7295256 6/#10/SYS REL
6/#10 PUDDING CHOCOLATE 50.11 7295272 6/#10/SYS REL
1/1 GA RELISH SWEET TFF 50.40 4233375 4/1GAL/CAJ CHF
1/50 LB RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN POLY 2511 4671434 1/50LB/SYSCLS
6/110Z RICE MEXICAN SEASONING MIX 27.47 1537735 6/110Z/FOOTHIL
6/#10 SAUCE CHEESE CHEDDAR AGED 61.82 0389365 6/#10/SYS REL
6/#10 SALSAMILD 45.01 9953068 6/4#10/REDGOLD
1/25LB SALT IODIZED GRANULAR TFF 7.09 4540373 1/25LB/SYS CLS
6/#10 SAUCE TOMATO CONC TFF 35.05 5096441 6/#10/SYS IMP
2/5LB SAUSAGE PORK CRUMBLE BREAKFAST 43.61 5971064 2/5LB/HORMEL
160/1 0Z SAUSAGE PORK LINK COOKED 1 0Z 37.25 6931547 160/10Z/SYS CLS
1/50 LB SHORTENING CAKE & ICING 68.19 4684250 1/50 LB/ SYS REL
2/5LB SOUR CREAM GRD A HVY BODY TFF 29.63 1186253 4/5LB/DAISY
6/1LB SPICE GARLIC POWDER 6.89 5239611 6/1LB/SYS CLS
6/20 0Z SPICE ONION POWDER 8.62 5229125 6/200Z/IMP/MCC
1/50 LB SUGAR GRANULATED EXTRA FINE IMP 30.11 1494651 1/50 LB/ PACKER
1/251B SUGAR LIGHT BRWN 28.58 1854694 1/25LB/SYSCLS
200/1.50Z |SYRUP PANCAKE & WAFFLE CUP TFF 21.07 3911490 100/10Z/SYSREL
32/307 TEA AUTOBREW 24.41 5097597 32/30Z/CITVIMP
1/251B TOMATO 5X6 56.42 1763432 1/25LB/IMPFRSH
360 TORTILLA FLOUR 6" PRESSED 27.09 2897767 18 /20CT /LA FAMA
6/#10 TOMATO DICED 3/4" IN JUICE TFF 45.91 4030318 6/#10/ANG MIA
6/#10 TROPICAL FRUIT SALAD 68.64 4989604 6/#10/DOLE
2/9%#AV TURKEY BRST OVEN PREPARED SKNLS 4.02 1355528 2/8-10#/SYS REL
6/#10 VEGETABLES MIXED TFF 45.84 4112926 6/#10/SYS CLS
4/1 GA VINEGAR WHI DISTILLED 40 GRAIN 16.93 4113049 [4/1GAL/SYSCLS
4/5lb YOGURT VANILLA LOW FAT 33.97 0022362 |4/5LB/UPSTATE




FORCE MAJEURE

Force Majeure: If by reason a Force Majeure, either party hereto shall be rendered unable wholly or in part
to carry out its obligations under the Contract Documents then such party shall give notice and full
particulars of Force Majeure in writing to the other party within a reasonable time after occurrence of the
event or cause relies upon, and the obligation of the party giving such notice, so far as it is affected by such
Force Majeure, shall be suspended during the continuance of the inability then claimed, except as
hereinafter provided, but for no longer period, and such party shall endeavor to remove or overcome such
inability with all reasonable dispatch.

The term Force Majeure as employed herein, shall mean acts of God, strikes, lockouts, or other industrial
disturbances, inability of manufacturer to supply product, act of public enemy, orders of any kind of
government of the United States or the State of Texas or any civil or military authority, insurrections, riots,
terrorist attacks, epidemics, landslides, earthquake, fires, volcanic disturbances, hurricanes, storms, floods,
washouts, droughts, arrests, restraint of government and people, civil disturbances, explosions, breakage or
accidents to machinery, pipelines or canals and epidemics / pandamics, or other causes not reasonably
within the control of the party claiming such inability. It is understood and agreed that the settiement of
strikes and lockouts shall be entirely within the discretion of the party having the difficulty, and that the above
requirement that any Force Majeure shall be remedied with all reasonable dispatch shall not require the
settlement of strikes and lockouts by acceding to the demands of the opposing party or parties when such
settlement is unfavorable in the judgment of the party having the difficulty.



How this
policy
helps our
customer

Sysco

At the heart of
food and service

Should a
return be
requested

after a
delivery has

been made.. |

5-D-02A Criteria for Customer Credit and Returns Policy

Customer

Credits & Returns

Sysco's approach to credits & returns remains simple and aimed at absolute customer
satisfaction and ensuring a food safe supply chain. In order to maintain the highest levels of
consumer food safety, we ask for your partnership in complying with this Customer Credit and
Returns Policy. By working together, we can maintain the food safety and integrity of our supply
chain.

Sysco Delivery Associates will return and credit any product that you do not accept at the time
of delivery. Checking-in your order also provides you with an opportunity to request credit
immediately if a product is invoiced but not included with your delivery. After delivery, credits
and returns are limited within the parameters established within this policy.

Benefits of our Product Return & Credit Policy:

 Ensures product wholesomeness & quality

* Reduces product loss that ultimately impacts both Sysco and our Customer

o Speeds the processing of returns and refunds

 Assures product handling is compliant with Sysco’s Food Safety Programs, USDA, FDA, OSHA
and HAZMAT requirements

* Reduces the risk that a tampered, damaged or unwholesome product could be redistributed to
another customer

(L N TNy

At Time of Delivery
« Most credits and returns should happen when you are receiving your delivery.
« Your Sysco Delivery Associate will gladly help you verify the items delivered agree with your
nvoice.
« You may choose to return any item for credit at the time of delivery unless the item is a
Special Order, Auto-Ship or Standing Order. Your Delivery Associate will make an adjustment
on your invoice to keep for your records.

v Temperature Controlled for Safety (Refrigerated and Frozen) are only eligible
for return at time of delivery. (see attached table for listing of Time and
Temperature Control for Safety)

« If a product is partially damaged, your Delivery Associate will make an immediate adjustment
on your invoice.

« Once you've approved your order (less any items you return) just sign the invoice, indicating
you're satisfied with the delivery.

L R R )

Returning Product after Delivery & Product Integrity Requirements
Refunds or credits for these items will be determined by the Operating Company.

All other returns are accepted for a limited amount of time as long as they meet the important
requirements below:
v" Refrigerated foods not classified as Time and Temperature Control for Safety:
within 48 hours from delivery.
v Frozen, dry and foodservice supplies: Within 14 days from delivery.
Temperature:
v All refrigerated and frozen products shall be required to be stored at proper
temperature to maintain food safety, product integrity and wholesomeness.
=  Frozen items: -18°Cto -9°C (0 to 15°F)
= Refrigerated items: 0°C to 4°C (32 to 40°F)

Packaging:

Products are returnable for full credit only when they are in the original package, free of
markings or damage, must be stored within the required temperature range at all times, and
within the specified return timeframe.

Page 1 of 2 September 15, 2019



Sysco

At the heart of
food and service

Additional Food Safety Guidelines

Time and Temperature Control for Safety (TCS):
Product Refrigerated Frozen

Deli Meats and Deli Poultry (RTE)

Deli Salads (RTE)

Eggs Cooked and Hard Boiled (RTE)

| Eggs, Shell (fresh)

Fruits, Salads & Vegetables (RTE

cut/processed)

Ground Beef (raw) X

Ground Beef (fresh, raw)

Ground Poultry (raw) X

Ground Poultry (fresh, raw)

Liquid Eggs (ready to use)

MAP or VAC Packaging

Meat (raw)

Milk (fluid), Ice cream mix

Molluscan Shellfish both in shell and

shucked (fresh, raw, not fully

cooked)

Molluscan Shellfish both in shell and X

shucked (raw, not fully cooked)

Pickles (refrigerated)

Poultry (raw)

Poultry and Meat (RTE)

Seafood (raw)

Seafood (RTE)

Soft Cheese

Sprouts (fresh)

K<

>

2K X2 <
>
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Note: Ready To Eat (RTE) = Ready to Serve (RTS)

These products may be eligible for credit after confirming with the Sysco Operating
Company, but are not allowed back into inventory if picked up after delivery

Chemicals

« Please treat chemical returns with extra attention. Federal HZMAT and OSHA regulations
prohibit the transport of open-container chemicals, or chemical products not in the original
packaging. Open/damaged chemical products or not in original packaging are non-returnable.

« A Sysco representative must inspect all chemical returns for damage and/or leakage before a
pick up and return order can be processed.

will Call
« Product picked up at Will Call can only be refused/returned at time of pick up. These items are
not returnable once they have been signed for and are out of Sysco’s control.

Special Order (Non-Stock) Items

« Special order items are products that we do not stock that were ordered especially for you.
Because they can’t be resold, they are not returnable except when damaged or of inferior
quality at the time of delivery.

Drop Shipments
« Drop shipments are sent directly to you from our suppliers. Contact your Sysco representative
about any unacceptable items within 48 hours of delivery.

Standing Order
« |s a pre-arranged process and agreement to always ship a defined product and quantity on
every order, repetitive.

Auto-Ship
« |s a pre-arranged process and one-time agreement (customer) to ship a defined product
and quantity on a defined ship date.

Restocking
« Any exceptions to these return guidelines may result in denial of credit or
may be subject to a 20% restocking fee.

5-D-02A Criteria for Customer Credit and Returns Policy Page 2 of 2 September 15, 2019



